THE CORPORATION OF THE

CITY OF WHITE ROCK
BYLAW 2500

A Bylaw to amend the
“White Rock Zoning Bylaw, 2012, No 2000 as amended

The CITY COUNCIL of the Corporation of the City of White Rock, in an open meeting
assembled, ENACTS as follows:

1.

Section 3.3.1 is amended by deleting the definition of “short term rental” or
“accessory vacation rental” and replacing with the following definition:

“ “Short term rental” means the rental of a residential dwelling unit to short-term
paying guests for periods not to exceed ninety (90) days ”

Section 5.5.1 (f) is amended by deleting “thirty (30) days” and replacing with
“ninety (90) days”

Section 5.8.1 (m) is amended by deleting “thirty (30) days" and replacng with
“ninety (90) days”

Section 6.4.1 (f) is amended by deleting “accessory vacation rental” and replacing
with “short term rental”

This Bylaw may be cited for all purposes as the “White Rock Zoning Bylaw, 2012,
No 2000 Amendment (Short Term Rentals) Bylaw 2024, No. 2500 .

“White Rock Zoning Bylaw, 2012, No 2000 Amendment (Short Term Rentals) Bylaw
2024, No. 2500” will take effect May 1, 2024.

RECEIVED FIRST READING on the day of
RECEIVED SECOND READING on the day of
PUBLIC HEARING held on the day of
RECEIVED THIRD READING on the day of
ADOPTED on the day of

MEGAN KNIGHT, MAYOR



TRACEY ARTHUR, DIRECTOR OF
CORPORATE ADMINISTRATION



